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TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE (Cont’d) 

10. EXTENSION OF SERVICE (Cont’d) 

If the estimated revenue for one year is greater than the cost to serve as describe herein, the Company may provide any new local 
facilities required at no cost to the Customer.  If the estimated revenue for one year is less than the cost to serve as described herein, the 
Company will require the Customer to pay a contribution in aid of construction equal to the difference between the annual cost to serve 
as calculated and the estimated revenue for one year divided by 21.95%, but in no case to exceed the installed cost of the new facilities
required.   If, however, the annual cost to serve excluding the cost of new facilities paid for by the Customer exceeds the estimated 
revenue for one year, the Company, will, in addition to a contribution in aid of construction, require a special minimum or other 
arrangement to compensate the Company for such deficiency in venue.

Except where service is rendered in accordance with 807 KAR 5:041, Section 11, as described herein, the Company may require the 
Customer to execute an Advance and Refund Agreement where the Company reasonably questions the longevity of the service or the
estimated energy use and demand requirements provided by the Customer.  Under the Advance and Refund Agreement, the Customer
shall pay the company the estimated total installed cost of the required new facilities which advance could be refunded over a five year 
period under certain circumstances. Over the five year period the Customer’ electric bill would be credited each month up to the amount
of 1/60th of the total amount advanced.

11. EXTENSION OF SERVICE TO MOBILE HOME.

The electrical facilities of the Company will be extended or expanded to supply electric service to mobile homes in accordance with 807
KAR 5:041, Section 12.

12. LOCATION AND MAINTENANCE OF COMPANY EQUIPMENT.

The Company shall have the right to construct its poles, lines and circuits on the property, and to place its transformers and other apparatus 
on the property or within the building of the Customer, at a point or points convenient for such purposes, as required to serve such
Customer, and the Customer shall provide suitable space for the installation of necessary measuring instruments so that the latter may be 
protected from injury by the elements or through the negligence or deliberate acts of the Customer or of any employee of the same.

13. BILLING FORM.

Pursuant to 807 KAR 5:006, Section 7, copies of the billing forms used by the Company are shown on Sheet Nos. 2-17 thru 2-22.   

14. RATE SCHEDULE SELECTION

The Company will explain to the Customer, at the beginning of service or upon request, the Company’s rates available to the Customer.
Company will assist Customer in the selection of the rate schedule best adapted to Customer’s service requirements, provided, however,
that Company does not assume responsibility for the selection or that Customer will at all times be served under the most favorable rate
schedule.

Customer may change their initial rate schedule selection to another applicable rate schedule at any time by either written notice to 
Company and/or by executing a new contract for the rate schedule selected, provided that the application of such subsequent selection 
shall continue for 12 months before any other selection may be made.  In no case will the Company refund any monetary difference 
between the rate schedule under which service was billed in prior periods and the newly selected rate schedules.

 (Cont’d on Sheet No. 2-9) 
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